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Peter Amos is a dedicated born-again Christian whose life's calling is deeply rooted in 
the unwavering faith and commitment to the word and work of God. With a pastoral 
heart that beats for the spiritual growth and well-being of youths and young adults, 
Amos has embarked on a transformative journey to make a lasting impact on the 
community and beyond. 

With a Bachelor of Science degree in Computer Science, Amos has not only embraced 
the faith but also complemented it with a robust academic foundation. The pursuit of 
excellence in the field led to the acquisition of numerous professional credentials in 
Technical Business Analysis, earning him recognition as a professional member of the 
British Computer Society - The Chartered Institute for IT. 

Throughout his career, which spans both city and government sectors, Amos has 
consistently demonstrated exceptional leadership, problem-solving skills, and a 
commitment to innovation. The experience has not only enabled him to navigate 
complex technical landscapes but has also instilled a profound sense of responsibility 
toward community development. 

It was the convergence of his professional expertise and deep-seated faith that 
propelled Amos to establish Open Gates Christian Organisation, a Christian 
organisation dedicated to sharing God's love and grace with those in need. Through 
this organisation, he has become a compassionate mentor, counsellor, and guide to 
countless young hearts seeking spiritual guidance and personal growth. 

Beyond his professional achievements and charitable pursuits, Amos is a loving 
husband and devoted father, embodying the same unwavering dedication and care 
within his family as he does in his philanthropic work. His ability to balance the 
responsibilities of leadership, family life, and community service underscores his 
exceptional character. 

Peter Amos continues to be an inspiration and a beacon of hope for those they serve, 
proving that a life steeped in faith, grounded in technical expertise, and fuelled by a 
heart of service can bring about profound and lasting change in the world. His legacy 
is a testament to the transformative power of faith and the enduring impact of selfless 
devotion to others. 

 


